CHAPTER 18

Building Regulations

Article I
General Provisions

Sec. 18-1-10
Certificate of occupancy

Sec. 18-1-20
Open soil percolation and profile test holes

Sec. 18-1-30
Fire extinguishers

Sec. 18-1-40
Detached garages and outbuildings

Sec. 18-1-50
Doubling of permit fees

Sec. 18-1-60
Penalties

Article II
Residential Code

Sec. 18-2-10
Adoption

Sec. 18-2-20
Copy on file

Sec. 18-2-30
Amendments

Article III
Electrical Code

Sec. 18-3-10
Adoption

Sec. 18-3-20
Copy on file

Sec. 18-3-30
Amendments

Article IV
Dangerous Buildings Code

Sec. 18-4-10
Adoption

Sec. 18-4-20
Copy on file

Sec. 18-4-30
Amendments

Article V
Fire Code

Sec. 18-5-10
Adoption

Sec. 18-5-20
Bureau of Fire Prevention

Sec. 18-5-30
Definitions

Sec. 18-5-40
Storage of flammable or combustible liquids in new outside aboveground tanks

Sec. 18-5-50
Amendments

Sec. 18-5-60
Violations and penalties

Article VI
Energy Conservation Code

Sec. 18-6-10
Adoption

Sec. 18-6-20
Copy on file

Sec. 18-6-30
Amendments

Article I
General Provisions

Sec. 18-1-10.
Certificate of occupancy.

Prior to the issuance of a certificate of occupancy, any person who builds or erects any structure must contact the Town by calling or writing the Building Official to obtain approval for issuance of the certificate of occupancy.  Approvals of the septic/sewer authority, the fire protection district, the Architectural Review Board and homeowners' association may be required.  Approval may, at the Town's sole discretion, require completion of the following improvements:
(1)
Installation of culverts.
(2)
Grading or regrading any disturbed or damaged roads or driveways or other areas necessary for proper drainage.
(3)
Installation and placement of up to twelve (12) tons of approved road base.
(4)
Any dirt, boulders or other material stored or remaining on the property described above shall be moved or distributed and arranged in such a way that it serves as landscaping and not piles of stored material.
(5)
All construction debris shall be removed from the site and properly disposed of.
(6)
All runoff created by or redirected by the construction, erection and landscaping of the structure on the property shall be treated, contained and controlled so that there are no increases in runoff or other drainage consequences resulting from said construction, erection and landscaping.
If weather conditions are such that the foregoing requirements cannot be determined or performed prior to the issuance of the certificate of occupancy, the person building or erecting the structure and requesting the certificate of occupancy shall pay to the Town, in cash or a letter of credit acceptable to the Town, an amount equal to one hundred fifty percent (150%) of the Town's estimated cost for performing such improvements.  The Town shall hold these funds in a non-interest-bearing account.  The funds may be commingled with other Town funds.  If the improvements are not completed, the Town may use the funds to complete the improvements.  Any unused funds shall be returned to the owner.  (Prior code 5-1-4)

Sec. 18-1-20.
Open soil percolation and profile test holes.

(a)
Issuance of permit.  Prior to the conducting of a soil percolation or profile test, the person conducting said test shall obtain from the Building Official, upon payment of a fee of twenty-five dollars ($25.00), a percolation test permit.  Such permit shall be valid for a period of sixty (60) days unless extended for good cause shown.  The person conducting such test further shall deposit with the Building Official a cash bond in the amount of one hundred fifty dollars ($150.00) for each proposed test, including but not limited to test holes for septic tanks, leach fields and soil profile analysis.  It is the responsibility of the person digging the hole, or the owner of the property in which the hole is dug, to fill the hole immediately upon completion of the test.  Any such hole shall be covered whenever left unattended or, alternatively, access thereto shall be prevented by a fence or other suitable structure.  At such time as the hole has been filled to the satisfaction of the Building Official, the cash bond shall be returned.
(b)
Nuisance declared; summary abatement.  The Board of Trustees hereby declares any open holes which are neither fenced nor covered and are more than three (3) feet deep, including percolation and profile test holes of any depth, to be nuisances subject to summary abatement by the Town.
(c)
Notice of abatement; failure to abate.  Whenever any such open hole is discovered, the Town shall cause a certified letter, return receipt requested, to be sent to the property owner at the address on file with the Summit County assessor.  Seventy-two (72) hours after the mailing of the letter, if the hole has not been filled, the Town may fill the hole through any means at its disposal, including hiring a private party, without competitive bids, to fill such hole at the owner's cost as provided in Subsection (d) below.
(d)
Abatement costs; lien.
(1)
If any owner fails to fill any hole after one (1) notice as provided in Subsection (c) above and the Town proceeds to fill such hole, the Town Clerk shall notify the owner, by regular mail, of the costs and expenses incurred in filling the hole.  The Town shall apply the amount of any deposit to the cost of filling the hole.  The owner shall have thirty (30) days from the date of mailing of the notice of costs to pay in full the costs and expenses in excess of those paid by the deposit, if any.  The funds not expended by the Town shall be returned to the depositor.
(2)
The owner of the property, according to the County Assessor's records, shall be held personally liable for any and all charges imposed under the provisions of this Section.  These charges shall become and remain a lien upon such property or premises until paid.  Such charges may be collected from the owner by an action in the name of the Town and said action may be for the enforcement of said lien, or such charges may be certified to the County Treasurer pursuant to statute and collected as tax.  If it is necessary for the Town to commence an action to collect such costs and expenses, the owner shall be liable for any court costs and attorney fees incurred by the Town.  (Prior code 3-1-1)

Sec. 18-1-30.
Fire extinguishers.

(a)
Required.  Each dwelling unit constructed within the limits of the Town shall from and after the effective date of this Code have installed therein at an accessible location a fire extinguisher of a ten-pound size, or its equivalent, and rated A.B.C., such extinguishers to have approval of the National Fire Rating Bureau.  No certificate of occupancy will be given until after evidence has been furnished that the extinguisher has been purchased and is in place.  

(b)
Time limit for installation; Town Clerk to be notified.  Each dwelling unit heretofore constructed in the Town shall, on or before November 1, 1973, have installed therein a fire extinguisher of the type described in Subsection (a) above.  The owner or occupant of each such dwelling unit shall notify the Town Clerk that said fire extinguisher has been purchased and is installed.
(c)
Recharging used extinguishers.  Any fire extinguisher which has been used shall be recharged promptly within thirty (30) days from the date of its use.  

(d)
Penalties.  Any violation of this Section will be punishable by a fine in the amount set out in Section 1-4-20 of this Code.  (Prior code 3-1-2; Ord. 06-01 §1, 2006)

Sec. 18-1-40.
Detached garages and outbuildings.

(a)
Approval required.  It is unlawful to erect or maintain any structure, including garage, storage shed, doghouse, tool shed or any other structure, unless such structure is approved in writing by the Board of Trustees.
(b)
Removal and penalty.  Any structure erected which is in violation of this Chapter shall be removed from the property thirty (30) days after notice requiring such removal has been sent by the Town.  After the passage of thirty (30) days, failure to remove the structure shall subject the owner to a fine and/or imprisonment as set forth in Section 1-4-20 of this Code.  (Prior code 3-1-3; Ord. 06-01 §1, 2006)

Sec. 18-1-50.
Doubling of permit fees.

Notwithstanding the provisions of Subsection 18-1-60(a) below, any person who builds or erects any structure or commences the building or erection of any structure without a building permit or in violation of any part of this chapter shall pay building and permit fees of at least twice the amount which would have been due upon timely application for a permit or license.  (Prior code 5-1-5)

Sec. 18-1-60.
Penalties.

(a)
Any person who builds or erects any structure without a building permit or in violation of any provision of this Chapter shall have his or her license revoked or suspended, may be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and may be punished by a fine of not less than twice the fee which would have been due had a permit been properly applied for or the provisions of this Chapter and Code followed and not more than one thousand dollars ($1,000.00) for each and every day the violation continues.  It is the intention of this legislation that fines levied against violators aggregate an amount at least double the fees otherwise due.  The Town recognizes that fees could exceed one thousand dollars ($1,000.00) based on the size and value of the project and believes fines assessed for continuing violations should be utilized to cause a doubling of the fees otherwise due.

(b)
It is unlawful for any person to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any building or structure or cause or permit the same to be done in violation of this Chapter.  Each such violation shall be punishable as set forth in Section 1-4-20 of this Code.  In addition to such penalty, the Town may initiate proceedings to prevent, enjoin, abate or remove the violation.  (Prior code 5-1-6; Ord. 06-01 §1, 2006)

ARTICLE II

Residential Code

Sec. 18-2-10.
Adoption.

The following standard code, as hereinafter amended, is hereby adopted by reference:  The International Residential Code, including Appendix G, 2006 Edition, published by the International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Ave., NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001-2070.  (Ord. 08-03, 2008)

Sec. 18-2-20.
Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the International Residential Code, certified to be a true copy, has been and is now on file in the office of the Building Official and may be inspected by any interested person during regular business hours.  The code as finally adopted shall be available for sale to the public through the office of the Town Clerk at a moderate price.  (Ord. 08-03, 2008)

Sec. 18-2-30.
Amendments.

The following amendments are hereby adopted as hereinafter provided:

(1)
Section R101.1 is hereby amended by the addition of the name, "The Town of Blue River."

(2)
Section R102.7, Existing structures, is hereby amended by deleting the reference to the International Property Maintenance Code.
(3)
Section R103.2, Building Official, is hereby amended by the addition of a paragraph, to read as follows:

"R103.2 Building Official.  The Building Official is hereby authorized and directed to enforce all of the provisions of this code; nevertheless, there shall be neither an express nor implied guaranty that all buildings and structures have been constructed in accordance with all of the provisions of this code, nor be deemed as any representation as to the quality of such buildings or structures in any manner."

(4)
Section R103.3, Deputies, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"R103.3 Deputies.  In accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction, the Building Official shall have the authority to appoint a deputy building official, related technical officers, inspectors, plan examiners and other assistants.  Such deputies shall have those powers and duties as have been expressly delegated by the Building Official, subject to modification from time to time."

(5)
Section R104.8, Liability, is hereby amended by the addition of a paragraph, to read as follows:

"The adoption and implementation of this code, as well as any previous Building Construction and Housing Standards adopted by the Town of Blue River, shall not be deemed to give rise to a duty of care on the part of any public entity, public employee or agent.  Neither this code nor any previous Building Construction and Housing Standard shall create any affirmative duty or be deemed to establish any affirmative representation on behalf of the Board of Trustees, the Building Official or the Summit County Government, its employees, officials or agents."
(6)
Section R105.3.1, Action on application, is hereby amended by the addition of a subsection, to read as follows:

"R105.3.1.2 Homeowner builder.  Anyone not meeting the definition of homeowner builder as set forth herein must be registered as a contractor with Summit County in order to pull the appropriate permits."

(7)
Section R106.1, Submittal documents, is hereby amended by the deletion of the second sentence, which is replaced to read as follows:

"The construction documents shall be prepared and stamped by a State of Colorado registered engineer and/or architect to certify compliance with this code, as well as the International Energy Conservation Code, 2006 Edition, as adopted."

(8)
Section R106.1, Submittal documents, is herby amended by the addition of a subsection, to read as follows:

"R106.1.4 Improvement location certificate.  An improvement survey of the lot shall be required by the Building Official to verify that the structure is located in accordance with approved plans.  Survey is required prior to the foundation walls being poured or installed.

"EXCEPTION:  Projects that do not change an existing building footprint or that lie within an existing building envelope do not require an improvement location certificate."

(9)
Section R106.3.3, Phased approval, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"R106.3.3 Phased approval.  Phased approval is not allowed.  A building permit can be issued only upon submission of required construction documents for the whole building or structure."

(10)
Section R107, Temporary structures and uses, is hereby amended by the addition of two (2) subsections, to read as follows:

"R107.5 Sanitation.  At the time of permit issuance, toilets are required on all construction sites and must remain on site until final inspections are complete.  Privies are prohibited.

"R107.6 Dumpsters.  At the time of permit issuance, Dumpsters adequate in size to handle trash and unwanted materials from the permitted project are required and must remain on site until final inspections are complete."

(11)
Section 107.3, Temporary power, is hereby amended to delete the reference to the ICC Electrical Code.

(12)
Section R108.2, Schedule of permit fees, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"R108.2 Schedule of permit fees.  On buildings, structures, gas, mechanical and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as required in accordance with the permit fee schedule below, except that electrical permit fees shall be determined as authorized by the Colorado Electrical Board.
"Building permit valuation will be determined as follows to establish the cost per square foot for new construction in the Town of Blue River:

"Building Valuation
	"1)  Finished wood frame construction
	$130.00/sq. ft.

	 2)  Semi-finished construction
	35.00/sq. ft.

	 3)  Unfinished space
	25.00/sq. ft.

	 4)  Wood framed garage construction
	35.00/sq. ft.

	 5)  Carport construction
	25.00/sq. ft.

	 6)  Covered deck/porch
	45.00/sq. ft.

	 7)  Open deck/porch
	20.00/sq. ft.


"For additions to existing buildings and structures, or for changes in space finish (i.e., unfinished to finished), the building permit valuation shall be determined by the increase in value indicated in the building valuation as a result of the project.

"Mechanical and plumbing valuations shall be determined as a percentage of total building valuation by multiplying the total building valuation as indicated on an associated building permit by a constant of 0.050.

"As an alternative, at the sole option of the building official, and for projects for which a valuation cannot be determined as above, projects shall be valued based upon an accurate estimate obtained from the contractor.  Such estimate shall include the total value, including materials, labor and permanent equipment.  If, in the opinion of the Building Official, the valuation is underestimated on the application, the permit shall be denied unless the applicant can show detailed estimates to meet the approval of the Building Official.

"BUILDING PERMIT FEE SCHEDULE

	"Total Valuation
	Fee

	$1.00 to $2,000.00
	$75.00

	$2,000.01 to $25,000.00
	$75.00 for the first $2,000.00 plus $15.00 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, to and including $25,000.00

	$25,000.01 to $50,000.00
	$420.00 for the first $25,000.00 plus $12.00 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, to and including $50,000.00

	$50,000.01 to $100,000.00
	$720.00 for the first $50,000.00 plus $8.00 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, to and including $100,000.00

	$100,000.01 to $500,000.00
	$1,120.00 for the first $100,000.00 plus $6.00 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, to and including $500,000.00

	$500,000.01 to $1,000,000.00
	$3,520.00 for the first $500,000.00 plus $5.00 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, to and including $1,000,000.00

	$1,000,000.01 and up
	$6,020.00 for the first $1,000,000.00 plus $4.00 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof."


(13)
Section R108.5, Refunds, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"R108.5 Refunds.  The Building Official may authorize refunding any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.  The Building Official may authorize the refunding of not more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under the permit issued in accordance with the adopted code.  The Building Official may authorize refunding of no more than 80 percent of any plan review fee collected, provided that the application for the permit for which a plan review fee was paid is withdrawn or cancelled before any plan reviewing is done.  The Building Official shall not authorize refunding of any fee paid except on written application filed by the original permit holder not later than 180 days after the date of fee payment."

(14)
Section R108, Fees, is hereby amended by the addition of two (2) subsections, to read as follows:

"R108.6  Work commencing before permit issuance.  Any person who commences work on a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system before obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to fees for an investigation in addition to any other required permit fees.  The investigation fee shall be collected whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued.  The investigation fee shall be equal to the permit fee as set forth in Section R108.2, Schedule of permit fees.  The payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions of this code or from any penalty prescribed by law.

"R108.7  Plan review fees.  When submittal documents are required by the building code, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of submitting the documents for plan review.  Said fee shall be 50 percent of the permit fee as set forth in Section R108.2, Schedule of permit fees.  In the event an applicant resubmits a full set of plans and specifications requesting reapproval of the permitted project, a full plan review fee will be charged.  In the event that an applicant resubmits partial 

plans and specifications requesting approval of minor changes, modifications or alterations, an additional plan review fee will be charged at the rate of $100.00 per hour.  Plan review fees are separate fees from the permit fees and are in addition to the permit fees."

(15)
Section R109.3, Inspection requests, is hereby amended by the addition of two (2) sentences, to read as follows:

"Unsafe access will be cause for reinspection.

"The Building Official may require every request for inspection be filed at least two (2) working days before such inspection is desired.  Such request may be in writing or by telephone at the option of the Building Official."

(16)
Section R109, Inspections, is hereby amended by the addition of a subsection, to read as follows:

"R109.5 Reinspections.  A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or reinspection when such portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete or when corrections called for are not made.  The reinspection fee shall be equal to $50.00, but not to exceed the permit fee for the permit under which the reinspection was conducted.  Reinspection fees may be assessed when any of the following conditions exist.

"a)  The applicable permit is not posted on the work site.

"b)  The approved plans (if applicable) are not readily available to the inspector.

"c)  The applicant fails to provide access on the date the inspection was requested.

"d)  There is a deviation from the approved plans requiring approval of the Building Official.

"In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspections of the work will be performed until such reinspection fees have been paid."

(17)
Section R110.1, Use and occupancy, is hereby amended by the addition of a subsection, to read as follows:

"R110.1.1 Furniture.  Placement of furniture constitutes occupancy."

(18)
Section R110, Certificate of occupancy, is hereby amended by the addition of a subsection, to read as follows:

"R110.3.1 Certificate of completion.  A notice of completion shall be issued for work not directly related to occupancy, such as reroofs, remodels, additions and decks, when such work complies with the provisions of this code and all other ordinances and regulations."

(19)
Section R202, Definitions, is hereby amended by the addition of the following definitions within the alphabetical order of the existing definitions:

"HOMEOWNER BUILDER.  Any individual who is the owner of the property subject to a building permit if the home is being built for the occupancy of the homeowner builder, and not for the purposes of commercial or residential development.  Such homeowner builders may be allowed to pull building and technical permits to perform work on a detached single-family residence, based entirely upon their classification as a Homeowner.  It shall be the duty of the 

individual applying for the permit to establish, to the satisfaction of the Building Official, that he or she is in fact a Homeowner Builder.

"EXCEPTION:  An owner of an attached single-family residence may be issued permits as a homeowner builder for exterior decks or detached accessory buildings.

"Homeowner builders may pull permits no sooner than 2 years after receiving a certificate of occupancy on any previous project done as a homeowner builder.

"EXCEPTION:  The ability to pull permits for alterations or additions to homes owned and occupied by any homeowner builder shall not be limited by any such time period constraints.

"LOFT.  A habitable room or floor in a building that is open to the room or floor directly below, which may or may not qualify as a mezzanine."

(20)
Table R301.2(1), Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria, is hereby amended by the insertion of the following criteria:

"a)  Ground snow load:  100 pounds per square foot.  There shall be no reduction in snow load for duration.

"b)  Wind Speed:  90 mph.  Exposure B.

"c)  Seismic Design Category:  B

"d)  Weathering:  Severe.

"e)  Frost line depth:  40 inches.

"f)  Termite:  None to Slight.

"g)  Decay:  None to Slight.

"h)  Winter Design Temperature:  -13°F.

"i)  Flood Hazards:  Undetermined."

(21)
Table R301.4, Minimum Uniformly Distributed Live Loads, is hereby amended by deleting exterior balconies, decks and fire escapes from the table and by the addition of footnote (g), to read as follows:

"(g)  The minimum uniformly distributed live loads for exterior balconies, decks and fire escapes shall be 125 pounds per square foot."

(22)
Section R325.1, Premises identification, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"R325.1 Premises identification.  Approved numbers or addresses shall be provided for all new and altered buildings in such a position as to be plainly visible and legible from the street or road fronting the property.  Address characters shall be at least five inches (127 mm) in height and shall be of a color that contrasts with the background on which they are mounted."

(23)
Section R502.1, Identification, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"R502.1 Identification.  Load-bearing dimension lumber and logs for joists, beams and girders shall be identified by a grade mark of a lumber grading or inspection agency that has been approved by an accreditation body that complies with DOC PS 20.  In lieu of a grade mark, a certificate of inspection issued by a lumber grading or inspection agency meeting the requirements of this section may be accepted."
(24)
Section R602.1, Identification, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"R602.1 Identification.  Load-bearing dimension lumber and logs for studs, plates and headers shall be identified by a grade mark of a lumber grading or inspection agency that has been approved by an accreditation body that complies with DOC PS 20.  In lieu of a grade mark, a certificate of inspection issued by a lumber grading or inspection agency meeting the requirements of this section may be accepted."
(25)
Section R801, General, is hereby amended by the addition of a subsection, to read as follows:

"R801.4 Ice and snow buildup.  Roofs shall be designed so as to prevent ice and snow from falling on exterior balconies/decks or on pedestrian or vehicular entrances and exits from the building."
(26)
Section R802.1, Identification, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"R802.1 Identification.  Load-bearing dimension lumber and logs for rafters, trusses and ceiling joists shall be identified by a grade mark of a lumber grading or inspection agency that has been approved by an accreditation body that complies with DOC PS 20.  In lieu of a grade mark, a certificate of inspection issued by a lumber grading or inspection agency meeting the requirements of this section may be accepted."
(27)
Section R902.1, Roofing covering materials, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"R902.1 Roofing covering materials.  Roofs shall be covered with materials as set forth in Sections R904 and R905.  Class A roofing shall be installed on all new buildings.  Class A roofing required to be listed by this section shall be tested in accordance with UL 790 or ASTM E108.  Roof assemblies with coverings of brick, masonry, slate, clay or concrete roof tile, exposed concrete roof deck, ferrous or copper shingles or sheets and metal sheets and shingles shall be considered Class A roof coverings."
(28)
Section R905.1, Roof covering application, is hereby amended by the addition of a subsection, to read as follows:

"R905.1.1 Ice dam protection.  An ice dam protection underlayment that consists of an approved self-adhering polymer modified bitumen sheet shall be used with all roof coverings.  This ice dam protection underlayment shall extend up the roof from the drip edge or eave and cover the entire roof deck surface.  Such underlayment shall extend a minimum of 18" up intersecting vertical walls."

(29)
Section R905.2.7.1, Ice protection, is hereby repealed in its entirety.
(30)
Section R905.4.3, Underlayment, is hereby repealed in its entirety.
(31)
Section R905.5.3, Ice protection, is hereby repealed in its entirety.
(32)
Section R905.6.3, Underlayment, is hereby repealed in its entirety.
(33)
Section R905.7.3, Underlayment, is hereby repealed in its entirety.
(34)
Section R905.8.3, Underlayment, is hereby repealed in its entirety.
(35)
Section R1002, Factory-Built Chimneys, is hereby amended by the addition of two (2) subsections, to read as follows:

"R1002.7 Factory-built chimney enclosures.  Factory-built Class 'AA' chimneys shall be enclosed within a continuous enclosure protected on the interior (flue) side by not less than one-hour fire-resistive construction.

"EXCEPTION:  That portion of the chimney located in the same room as the appliance and the portion of the chimney above the finished roof are not required to be enclosed.  However, if they are enclosed, the interior of the shaft shall be protected by not less than one-hour fire-resistive construction.

"R1002.8 Factory-built chimney.  Factory-built chimneys shall be supported at intervals not to exceed 10 feet by wall straps or equivalent.

"The points of termination of a factory-built chimney shall not be within 10 inches vertically of the point of termination of any adjacent chimney or appliance vent within 24 inches horizontally.  No factory-built chimney shall terminate closer than 24 inches to combustible finish materials."

(36)
Section R1004.4, Unvented gas log heaters, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"R1004.4 Unvented gas log heaters.  Installation of unvented gas log heaters is prohibited."
(37)
Section R1004, Factory-built fireplaces, is hereby amended by the addition of two (2) subsections, to read as follows:

"R1004.5 Factory-built fireplace enclosures.  Combustible construction enclosing factory-built fireplaces equipped with Class 'AA' chimneys shall be protected on the interior (fireplace) side by not less than one-hour fire-resistive construction.

"R1004.6  Energy conservation.  All factory-built fireplaces shall have glass or metal doors to limit the drafting of conditioned room air."
(38)
Chapter 10, Chimneys and Fireplaces, is hereby amended by the addition of a new section, to read as follows:

"R1007  Limitation on the type of devices.  Solid fuel-burning devices that are not properly certified are prohibited in new construction.

"CERTIFIED SOLID FUEL-BURNING DEVICE is a solid fuel-burning device which is certified by the Air Pollution Control Division of the Colorado Department of Health or approved by the Building Official as meeting the emission standards set forth in Section IV of Regulation No. 4 of Volume I of the Colorado Air Quality Control Commission (EPA Phase II or III).

"NEW CONSTRUCTION, for the purpose of this section, is construction of a residential, commercial, industrial, agricultural or accessory building.  This shall include any modification, replacement or relocation of existing solid fuel-burning devices.  However, modifications to solid fuel-burning devices shall not include repair, replacement or relocation of the flue pipe.

"SOLID FUEL-BURNING DEVICES are any fireplace, stove, firebox or other device intended and/or used for the purpose of burning wood, coal, pulp, paper, pellets or other nonliquid or nongaseous fuel."

(39)
Chapter 11, Energy Efficiency, is hereby repealed in its entirety.
(40)
Section M1703.4, Under-floor combustion air, is hereby amended by the addition of the following sentence at the end of the paragraph:

"Combustion air terminations shall be a minimum of 36" above grade."
(41)
Section M1703, All air from outdoors, is hereby amended by the addition of a subsection, to read as follows:

"M1703.6 Combustion air exterior terminations.  All exterior combustion air terminations to be a minimum of 36 inches above grade."
(42)
Section M1804.2.6 #4, Mechanical draft systems, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"4.  All exterior combustion air terminations to be a minimum of 36 inches above grade."
(43)
Section M2002.4, Pressure-relief valve, is hereby amended by the addition of a sentence, to read as follows:

"All boiler rooms are to be provided with a floor drain."
(44)
Section G2406.2, Prohibited locations, is hereby amended to eliminate Exceptions 3 and 4.
(45)
Section G2412.1, Scope, is hereby amended by the addition of a subsection, to read as follows:

"G2412.1.2  Gas meters.  Gas meters must be protected from falling ice and snow."
(46)
Section G2412, General, is hereby amended by the addition of four (4) subsections, to read as follows:

"G2412.9 Propane appliances.  All propane appliances shall be regulated by the requirements of this section and subject to the approval of the Building Official.  Alternatives to the requirements of this section may be approved by the Building Official.

"G2412.9.1 Location.  No propane or butane fuel-burning appliance shall be installed below finished grade such as in a basement or crawl space.

"G2412.9.2 Alarm.  All buildings served by propane or butane shall be equipped with a suitable flammable gas alarm located in the basement, crawl space or the lowest space in the structure, within twelve inches (12") of the floor or ground.  Such alarm shall be equipped with an automatic switch to be used to activate a solenoid valve as required in Section G2412.9.3.

"G2412.9.3 Shutoff valve.  For any propane- or butane-supplied structure requiring a flammable gas alarm (Section 2412.9.2), there shall be installed in the propane or butane supply line, external to the structure, a solenoid valve to effectively shut off the fuel supply to the building in the event the flammable gas detector detects the presence of propane or butane gas."

(47)
Section G2417.4.1, Test pressure, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"G2417.4.1 Test pressure.  The test pressure to be used shall not be less than one and one-half times the proposed maximum working pressure, but not less 

than 10 psig (69 kPa gauge), irrespective of design pressure.  Where the test pressure exceeds 125 psig (862 kPa gauge), the test pressure shall not exceed a value that produces a hoop stress in the piping greater than 50 percent of the specified yield strength of the pipe."

(48)
Section G2425.8, Equipment not required to be vented, is hereby amended to eliminate Item #7, Room heaters listed for unvented use.
(49)
Section G2432, Decorative appliances for installation in fireplaces, is hereby amended by the addition of a subsection, to read as follows:

"G2432.4 Gas logs.  Gas logs may be installed in solid fuel-burning fireplaces, provided that:

"1)  The gas log is installed in accordance with the manufacturer's installation instructions.

"2)  If the fireplace is equipped with a damper, it shall either be removed or permanently secured in an open position.

"3)  The flue passageway shall be not less than 1 square inch per 2,000 Btu/h input and not more than 4 square inches per 2,000 Btu/h input.

"4)  Gas logs shall be equipped with a pilot and shall have a listed safety shutoff valve.

"5)  Gas logs shall be vented with a Class 'AA' chimney.

"6)  Gas logs may be installed in factory-built fireplaces only when (a) the fireplace and gas logs are listed for use together as an individual unit, (b) the fireplace is approved for use with any gas log or (c) the fireplace manufacturer provides prior written approval for the installation.

"EXCEPTION:  The installation of gas logs in factory-built fireplace units for which the manufacturer cannot be identified or located may be approved by the Building Official at his or her discretion.  Any approval shall be based at a minimum on written evidence submitted by the gas log manufacturer that the installation of their product will not compromise the integrity of the existing fireplace."

(50)
Section G2445, Unvented room heaters, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"Prohibited installation.  Installation of unvented room heaters is prohibited."
(51)
Section P2801.5.2, Pan drain termination, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"2801.5.2 Pan drain termination.  The pan drain shall extend full size and terminate over a suitably located indirect waste receptor or floor drain and terminate not less than 6 inches and not more than 24 inches above the adjacent ground surface."
(52)
Chapters 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41 and 42 are repealed in their entirety.  (Prior code 5-1-3A; Ord. 05-01 §5, 2005; Ord. 06-01 §1, 2006; Ord. 08-03, 2008)

ARTICLE III

Electrical Code

Sec. 18-3-10.
Adoption.

The following standard code, as hereinafter amended, is hereby adopted by reference:  the National Electrical Code, 2005 Edition, published by the National Fire Protection Association, Inc., One Batterymarch Park, Quincy, Massachusetts 02269-7471.  (Prior code 5-1-2B; Ord. 06-01 §1, 2006; Ord. 08-03, 2008)

Sec. 18-3-20.
Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the National Electrical Code, certified to be a true copy, has been and is now on file in the office of the Building Official and may be inspected by any interested person during regular business hours.  The code as finally adopted shall be available for sale to the public through the office of the Town Clerk at a moderate price.  (Ord. 06-01 §1, 2006; Ord. 08-03, 2008)

Sec. 18-3-30.
Amendments.

The following amendments are hereby adopted as hereinafter provided:

(1)
Chapter 2, Article 210-8(A)(1), is hereby amended to read as follows:

"(1)  Each bathroom shall have its own ground fault circuit interrupter (GFCI) receptacle with the capability of being reset at that location.  (Note:  for safety and convenience of the occupant after tripping.)  All future remodeling and replacement of devices shall be required to adhere to the above requirement."

(2)
Chapter 2, Article 210-52(G), Basements and Garages, is hereby amended by the addition of a paragraph, to read as follows:

"For a single-family dwelling, basements with wood frame foundation walls, furred-out framing at foundation walls, or a separate finish material applied to the face of the foundation walls, or where the framed wall of a combination concrete or masonry and framed foundation exceeds one-half of the height of the wall, receptacle outlets shall be installed in accordance with Section 210-52(A)."

(3)
The first paragraph of Chapter 2, Article 210-70(A)(2)(b), is hereby amended by the addition of the following sentence:
"At least one wall switch controlling an interior lighting outlet shall be installed at each exterior entrance or exit that is grade accessible."

(4)
The first sentence of Chapter 2, Article 230-28, Service Masts as Supports, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"Where a service mast is used for support of the service-drop conductors, it shall be a minimum of 2" rigid metal conduit supported by braces or guy wires to safely withstand the strain imposed by the service drop."
(5)
Chapter 3, Article 310-2(B), Conductor Material, is hereby amended by the addition of the following sentence:

"No aluminum conductors shall be permitted for 15A or 20A branch circuits."
(Prior code 5-1-3B; Ord. 06-01 §1, 2006; Ord. 08-03, 2008)

ARTICLE IV
Dangerous Buildings Code
Sec. 18-4-10.
Adoption.
The following standard code, as hereinafter amended, is hereby adopted by reference:  the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997 Edition, published by the International Conference of Building Officials, 5360 South Workman Mill Road, Whittier, California.  (Prior code 5-1-2D; Ord. 06-01 §1, 2006)

Sec. 18-4-20.
Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, certified to be a true copy, has been and is now on file in the office of the Town Clerk and may be inspected by any interested person between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, holidays excepted.  The code as finally adopted shall be available for sale to the public through the office of the Town Clerk at a moderate price.  (Ord. 06-01 §1, 2006)

Sec. 18-4-30.
Amendments.

The following amendment is hereby adopted as hereinafter provided:  Section 301, General, is hereby amended to change the definition of BUILDING CODE to read as follows:
"BUILDING CODE is the International Residential Code, published by the International Code Council, Inc., as adopted by this jurisdiction."
(Prior code 5-1-3D; Ord. 06-01 §1, 2006)
ARTICLE V
Fire Code

Sec. 18-5-10.
Adoption.

There is hereby adopted by the Town, for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire and explosion, the International Fire Code, 2003 Edition, published by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795, except as amended, modified or deleted hereinafter.  (Prior code 5-4-1; Ord. 06-01 §1, 2006)

Sec. 18-5-20.
Bureau of Fire Prevention.
(a)
The adopted fire code shall be enforced by the Bureau of Fire Prevention in the Fire Department of the Red, White and Blue Fire Protection District, which is hereby established and which shall operate under the supervision of the Fire Chief.
(b)
The officer in charge of the Bureau of Fire Prevention shall be appointed by the Fire Chief on the basis of examinations to determine qualifications.
(c)
The Fire Chief may detail such members of the Fire Department as inspectors as shall from time to time be necessary.  The Fire Chief shall recommend inspectors, who, when such authorization is made, shall be selected through an examination to determine their fitness for the position.  The examination shall be open to the members and nonmembers of the Fire Department, and appointments made after examination shall be for indefinite terms with removal only for cause.  (Prior code 5-4-2)

Sec. 18-5-30.
Definitions.

(a)
Whenever the words Red, White and Blue Fire Protection District or Fire Department are used in this Chapter, they shall be held to mean the Red, White and Blue Fire Protection District.
(b)
Whenever the word jurisdiction is used in the adopted fire code, it shall be held to mean the Red, White and Blue Fire Protection District.
(c)
Whenever the term Corporation Counsel is used in the adopted fire code, it shall be held to mean the attorney for the Red, White and Blue Fire Protection District.  (Prior code 5-4-3)
Sec. 18-5-40.
Storage of flammable or combustible liquids in new outside aboveground tanks.

(a)
Storage limited.  The limits referred to in Section 79.501 of the Uniform Fire Code in which the storage of flammable or combustible liquids is restricted are hereby established as follows:  within the incorporated limits of the towns of Breckenridge and Blue River and unincorporated land within Summit County.  

(b)
Exception.  The following zoning districts within the unincorporated portions of Summit County are exempt from the provisions of Subsection (a) above:  A-1 (Agricultural), I-1 (Industrial), M-1 (Mining) and NR-2 (Natural Resources, Public Lands).  (Prior code 5-4-4; Ord. 06-01 §1, 2006)
Sec. 18-5-50.
Amendments.

The following amendments are hereby adopted as hereinafter provided:

(1)
Section 1.103, Scope, is hereby amended by the addition of the following:
"(d)  Alternative Decisions.  In those instances where the Fire Chief is granted the authority to make various alternative decisions through the phrase 'or as approved by the Fire Chief,' the Fire Chief's decision shall be accompanied by adequate findings.  These findings shall be in writing, shall indicate the justification for the decision and may include conditions necessary to preserve the health, safety and welfare of the community.  A copy of the modification or alternative decision shall be on file with the RED, WHITE AND BLUE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT."
(2)
Section 2.303, Board of Appeals, is hereby deleted and amended by the addition of the following:
"(a)  General.  In order to determine the suitability of alternative materials and type of construction and to provide for reasonable interpretations of the provisions of this code, there shall be and hereby is created a Board of Appeals.  The Board of Appeals shall consist of the Board of Directors for the RED, WHITE AND BLUE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT.
"The board shall adopt reasonable rules and regulations for conducting its investigations and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the Fire Chief, with a duplicate copy to the appellant.  The Fire Chief shall be an ex officio member and shall act as secretary of the board.
"Whenever the Fire Chief shall disapprove an application or refuse to grant a permit applied for, or when it is claimed that the provisions of the code do not apply, or that the true intent and meaning of this code, or any code of another political entity which is enforced by the RED, WHITE AND BLUE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT as required by Section 32-1-1001(1)(d) or (3)(b), C.R.S., as 
amended, have been misconstrued or wrongly interpreted, the applicant may appeal the decision of the Fire Chief to the Board of Directors for the RED, WHITE AND BLUE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT within thirty (30) days from the date of the decision appealed.
"(b)  Limitations of Authority.  The Board of Appeals shall have no authority relative to interpretation of the administrative provisions of this code nor shall the board be empowered to waive requirements of this code.
"Orders to comply issued under the authority of Section 32-1-1002(3)(c), C.R.S., as amended, shall be appealed to District Court as provided by state statute."
(3)
Portions of Section 4.108, Permits, are hereby amended to read as follows:
"A permit shall be obtained from the Bureau of Fire Prevention prior to engaging in the following activities, operations, practices or functions.  Permits required by this section shall expire on a specified date or be nonexpiring.  Any governmental entity of the State of Colorado shall obtain a permit, but shall not be subject to any fees.  Each permit required by this section shall be subject to a $25.00 fee.
"b.1.  Bonfires or rubbish fires.  To kindle or authorize the kindling or maintenance of bonfires or rubbish fires ‑ See Section 11.101.  No fee required.
"f.3.  Flammable or combustible liquids and tanks.  A.  To store, handle or use Class I liquids in excess of 10 gallons in a building or in excess of 10 gallons outside of any building, except that a permit is not required for the following:"
(4)
The below portions of Section 4.108, Permits, are hereby deleted:
"c.1.  Candles and open flames in assembly areas.
"o.2.B.  Open-flame devices in marinas.
"p.1.  Parade floats.
"t.1.  Tank vehicles.
"w.2.  Welding and cutting operations."
(5)
Section 9.105, Definitions, is hereby amended by the addition of the following:
"CENTRAL STATION SERVICE.  A system, or group of systems, in which the operations of circuits and devices are signaled automatically to, recorded in, maintained and supervised from an approved central station having competent and experienced observers and operators who shall, upon receipt of a signal, take such action as shall be required by the 1987 edition of National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Standard 71 and the 1986 edition of NFPA Standard 72C.  Such systems shall be controlled and operated by a person, firm or corporation whose principal business is the furnishing and maintaining of supervised signaling service."
(6)
Section 9.115, Definitions, is hereby amended by the addition of the following terms:
"MONITORED is the sending of fire alarm signals using circuits installed in accordance with the 1987 edition of National Fire Protection Association Standard 71 to transmit alarm, supervisory and trouble signals from one or more 
protected premises to an approved remote station monitoring center at which appropriate action is taken.
"REMOTE STATION MONITORING CENTER.  An office to which remote alarm and supervisory signaling devices are connected, and where personnel are in attendance at all times to supervise the circuits and investigate signals.  A remote station monitoring center shall include central station service.
"REMOTE STATION MONITORING CENTER, DEALER.  Any individual, partnership, corporation or other entity engaged in the selling of central station services for a remote station monitoring center.  A remote station monitoring center dealer may also investigate signals for a remote station monitoring center.
"SUPERVISED, as it applies to premise wiring, is any electrical circuit having a trouble signal which indicates the occurrence of a single open or a single ground fault, on any installation wiring circuit, that would prevent proper alarm operation."
(7)
Section 10.203, Hydrant Use Approval, is hereby deleted and amended by the addition of the following:
"No person shall use or operate any hydrant or other valves installed on any water system intended for use by the Fire Chief for fire suppression purposes and which is accessible to any public highway, alley or private way open to or generally used by the public, unless such person first secures permission from the fire department and the water department having jurisdiction.  This section does not apply to the use of a hydrant or other valves by a person or agent employed by and authorized to make such use by the water company which supplies water to such hydrants or other valves."

(8)
Section 10.207, Fire Apparatus Access Roads, is hereby deleted and amended by the addition of the following:
"(c)  Width.  Where Town or county road standards exist, fire apparatus access roads shall meet those standards.  Where no standards exist, the minimum unobstructed width of a fire apparatus access road shall be not less than 24 feet or as approved by the Fire Chief."
(9)
Section 10.208, Premises Identification, is hereby deleted and amended by the addition of the following:
"(a)  General.  Approved characters which identify addresses shall be placed on all new and existing buildings in such a position as to be plainly visible and legible from the street or road fronting the property.  Address characters shall be affixed to the side of the building which faces the street or road from which the building is addressed.
"EXCEPTION:  Address characters may be affixed to a sign or post located adjacent to the street or road from which the building is addressed.
"Buildings located 150 feet or more from the edge of the street or road shall provide roadside address characters.  The address characters may be affixed to either a sign or post.  The roadside address characters shall be less than 25 feet from the edge of the road.
"(b)  Graphics.  The color of address characters shall be in high contrast with their background.  Characters shall be 5 inches or more in height.
"Alternative building address signage may be approved by the Fire Chief.
"(c)  Street or Road Signs.  When required by the Fire Chief, a street or road shall be identified with approved signs."
(10)
Section 10.209, Key Box, is hereby amended by the addition of the following:
"All buildings, except one- and two-family dwellings, that a fire alarm or automatic extinguishing system has been installed in, shall have a key box installed for fire department use.  Keys necessary for operation of such systems and keys necessary for controlled access to such systems will be made available before occupancy of the building and maintained thereafter.
"A key box may be required at each entrance into a building.  Fire command centers may also be required to install an approved key vault capable of being dual locked."
(11)
Section 10.301, Installation, is hereby deleted and amended by the addition of the following:
"(c)  Water Supply.  An approved water supply capable of supplying the required fire flow for fire protection shall be provided to all premises upon which buildings or portions of buildings are hereafter constructed.  When any portion of the building protected is in excess of 150 feet from a water supply on a public street, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the building, there shall be provided, when required by the Fire Chief, on-site hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow.
"Water supply may consist of reservoirs, pressure tanks, elevated tanks, water mains or other fixed system capable of providing the required fire flow.  In setting the requirement for fire flow, the Fire Chief shall be guided by the provisions in Appendix III-A of this code, as amended.
"The location, number and type of fire hydrants connected to a water supply capable of delivering the required fire flow shall be provided on the public street or on the site of the premises to be protected as required and approved by the Fire Chief.  All hydrants shall be accessible to the fire department apparatus by roadways meeting the requirements of Section 10.207.
"(d)  Fire Hydrant Markers.  When required by the Fire Chief, hydrant locations shall be identified by the installation of reflective markers.
"(e)  Timing of Installation.  When fire protection facilities are to be installed by the developer, such facilities, including all surface access roads, shall be installed and made serviceable prior to and during the time of construction.  When alternative methods of protection, as approved by the Fire Chief, are provided, the above may be modified or waived.
"(f)  Approval and Testing.  All fire alarm systems, fire hydrant systems, fire-extinguishing systems (including automatic sprinklers), wet and dry standpipes, basement inlet pipes and other fire-protection systems and appurtenances thereto shall meet the approval of the fire department as to installation and location and shall be subject to such periodic tests as required by the Fire Chief.  Plans and specifications shall be submitted to the fire department for review and approval prior to construction.
"(g)  Maximum Fire Flow.  All buildings that exceed a 3,500 G.P.M. fire flow shall be provided with an automatic sprinkler system throughout."
(12)
Section 10.302, Maintenance, is hereby deleted and amended by the addition of the following:
"(a)  General.  All sprinkler systems, fire hydrant systems, standpipe systems, fire alarm systems, portable fire extinguishers, smoke and heat ventilators, smoke-removal systems, emergency lighting, exit lights and other fire-protective or extinguishing systems or appliances shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and shall be replaced or repaired where defective.  Fire-protective or extinguishing systems coverage, spacing, specifications and any repairs or servicing shall be maintained in accordance with recognized standards at all times.  Such systems shall be extended, altered or augmented as necessary to maintain and continue protection whenever any building so equipped is altered, remodeled or added to.
"Exception:  Systems not required by this or any other code need not be extended, altered nor augmented.
"Plans and specifications, in accordance with recognized standards, for all additions and alterations shall be submitted to the fire department for review and approval prior to construction.
"(b)  Systems in high-rise buildings.  The building owner shall be responsible for assuring that the fire and life safety systems required by Sections 1807 and 1907 of the Uniform Building Code shall be maintained in an operable condition at all times.  Unless otherwise required by the Fire Chief, annual tests of such systems shall be conducted by qualified persons approved by the Fire Chief.  A written record shall be maintained and be made available to the inspection authority.
"(c)  Sprinkler valves.  In addition to other provisions of this code, all sprinkler system control valves shall be maintained open by an approved fire department lock and chain in addition to a supervised tamper switch.
"(d)  Elevators.  All elevators shall be constructed and maintained as set forth in Chapter 51 of this Uniform Building Code.
"Elevators may use a telephone to meet the requirement for two-way communication between the elevator and a constantly attended location outside the hoistway.  When a telephone is used, the person shall not have to perform any action other than lifting the receiver and waiting for someone to answer the call."
(13)
Section 10.305, Installation of Fixed Fire Protection System, is hereby deleted and amended by the addition of the following:
"(d)  Standards.  Fire-extinguishing systems shall comply with the 1987 edition of National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Standard 13, including Appendix A; the 1984 edition of NFPA Standard 130; the 1988 edition of NFPA Standard 13-R and the 1986 edition of NFPA Standard 14.
"EXCEPTION:  Automatic sprinkler systems may be connected to the domestic water supply main when approved by the Fire Chief, provided the domestic water supply is of adequate pressure, capacity and sizing for the combined domestic and 
sprinkler requirements.  In such case, the sprinkler system connection shall be made between the public water main or meter and the building shutoff valve, and there shall not be intervening valves or connections.  The fire department connection may be omitted when approved by the fire department.
"(e)  Control Valves.  Separate automatic sprinkler system control valves on each floor, story or portion thereof may be required by the Fire Chief.
"(f)  Labeling.  All labels required by or used in conjunction with automatic fire extinguishing systems shall be approved.  Labels shall be durable, permanent and have lettering contrasting with the background.  More than one label may be required depending on the installation.  The proposed labeling shall be submitted for review along with the plans and specifications prior to installation."
(14)
Section 10.306.(b), Installation of Fixed Fire Protection System, is hereby amended by the addition of the following:
"5.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in parking garages when portions of the garage are greater than 75 feet from any vehicular entrance."
(15)
Section 10.306, Automatic Fire-extinguishing Systems, is hereby amended to read as follows:
"(c)  Group A Occupancies.  

"1.  Drinking and/or Dining.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in areas used for drinking and/or dining, and accessory uses where the total occupant load of such rooms and accessory uses is 50 or more."

(16)
Section 10.307, Sprinkler System Monitoring, is hereby deleted and amended by the addition of the following:
"All required automatic sprinkler systems shall be monitored by an approved remote station monitoring center.
"EXCEPTION:  Buildings with only sprinklered trash chutes."
(17)
Section 10.309, Standpipes, is hereby amended to read as follows:
"(a)  General.  Standpipes shall comply with the requirements of this section and the 1986 edition of National Fire Protection Association Standard 14.
"(b)  Where Required.  Standpipe systems shall be provided as set forth in Table No.1 0.309.
"(c)  Location of Class I Standpipes.  There shall be a Class I standpipe outlet connection at every floor-level landing of every stairway above or below grade and on each side of the wall adjacent to the exit opening of a horizontal exit.  Outlets at stairways shall be located within the exit enclosure or, in the case of smoke-proof enclosures, within the vestibule or exterior balcony, giving access to the stairway."
(18)
Section 10.309, Table No. 10.309, No. 2, Standpipe Requirements, is hereby amended to read as follows:
"2.  Occupancies 3 or more stories but less than 150 feet in height, except Group R, Div. 3.
"Note 7:  Hose cabinets for these requirements shall be installed at time of construction.  The Fire Chief may approve the elimination of hose and require an approved A.B.C. extinguisher in its place.
"Note 8:  In three-story buildings where no more than six individual dwelling units are directly served by a stairway and sufficient emergency vehicle access is provided, the standpipe may be eliminated."
(19)
Section 10.402, Fire Assembly for Protection of Openings, is hereby amended by the addition of the following:
"When required by the Fire Chief, a sign shall be permanently displayed on all doors accessing rooms deemed necessary for emergency recognition, including electrical, mechanical, boiler, main sprinkler valve, fire alarm panel, fire command center and any other room.  The color and design of the lettering shall be in high contrast with the background.  Words shall be in letters not less than 1 inch high."
(20)
Section 11.405, Maintenance of Chimneys and Heating Appliances, is hereby amended by the addition of the following:
"Chimneys and fireboxes for wood-burning appliances shall be inspected annually to ensure adequate draft, clearance, soundness and freedom from combustible deposits.  A certificate of inspection in a form acceptable to the fire department shall be forwarded to the Fire Chief upon completion.
"EXCEPTION.  Group R, Division 3 and Group M Occupancies."
(21)
The third paragraph of Section 12.101, Maintenance of Exits, is hereby deleted and amended by the addition of the following:
"Exits conforming to the requirements of the Building Code under which they were constructed may be considered as complying exits if, in the opinion of the Fire Chief, they do not constitute a distinct hazard to life.  The requirements of Chapter 33 of the Uniform Building Code and the required fire-resistive rating of walls, ceilings and openings that are part of an exit shall be maintained."
(22)
Section 12.104, Doors, is hereby amended by the addition of the following Exception 3:
"3.  In Group B Occupancies with an occupant load of less than 300, manually operated edge- or surface-mounted flush bolts and surface bolts may be used on one leaf of a pair of doors on the main exit.  There shall be a readily visible, durable sign on, or adjacent to, these doors stating BOTH DOOR LEAVES TO REMAIN UNLOCKED DURING BUSINESS HOURS.  This sign shall be in letters not less than 1 inch high on a contrasting background.  The use of this Exception may be revoked by the Fire Chief or Building Official for due cause."
(23)
Section 12.107, Exit Illumination, is hereby deleted and amended by the addition of the following:
"(a)  General.  Exit illumination shall be provided and maintained in accordance with the Building Code.  Exits shall be illuminated when the building or structure is occupied.
"Fixtures required for exit illumination shall be supplied from separate sources of power where required by Subsection (c).
"(b)  Emergency Power Equipment.  Equipment providing emergency power for exit illumination and exit signs shall be maintained in an operable condition.
"(c)  Separate Sources of Power.  The power supply for exit illumination shall normally be provided by the premises' wiring system.  In the event of its failure, illumination shall be automatically provided from an emergency system for Group I, Division 1 Occupancies and for all other occupancies where the occupant load served by the exiting system exceeds 50.
"For high-rise buildings, see Uniform Building Code Section 1807.  For smoke-proof enclosures, see Uniform Building Code Section 3310(g)9.
"Emergency systems shall be supplied from storage batteries or an on-site generator set, and the system shall be installed in accordance with the requirements of the Electrical Code."
(24)
The second paragraph of Section 14.101, Scope, is hereby deleted and amended by the addition of the following:
"Fire alarm systems shall be in accordance with this section and fire department policy.  For the purposes of this section, area separation walls shall not define separate buildings."
(25)
Section 14.103, General Requirements, is hereby amended by the addition of the following:
"(b)  System Design.  Fire alarm systems, automatic fire detectors, emergency voice/alarm communications systems and notification devices shall be designed, installed and maintained in accordance with the 1987 edition of National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Standard 72A, 1986 edition of NFPA Standard 72C, 1984 edition of NFPA Standard 72E, 1985 edition of NFPA Standard 72H, 1987 edition of NFPA Standard 70, Article 760 and other nationally recognized standards."
(26)
Section 14.104, Required Installations, is hereby deleted and amended by addition of the following:
"(a)  General.  An approved fire alarm system shall be installed when required by this section.
"(b)  Type of System.  A manual or automatic fire alarm system or both shall be installed in occupancies in accordance with the following:
"1.  A manual fire alarm system shall be installed in:
"A.  Group H Occupancies used for the manufacture of organic coatings.

"B.  Group H, Division 6 Occupancies as set forth in Article 51.

"2.  A manual and automatic fire alarm system shall be installed in:
"A.  Group A Occupancies.
"EXCEPTION:  Group A occupancies protected by an approved automatic fire sprinkler system need not provide automatic fire alarm protection in the assembly rooms.
"B.  Group B, Division 2 Occupancies as set forth in Chapter 33 of the Building Code.
"C.  As set forth in Article 81 of this code.
"D.  Group E Occupancies having more than 50 occupants.
"E.  Group I Occupancies.
"F.  Group R, Division 1 Occupancies specified in Subsection (c).
"(c)  Group R, Division 1 Occupancies.  A manual and automatic fire alarm system shall be installed in apartment houses three or more stories in height or containing more than 15 dwelling units and in hotels three or more stories in height or containing 20 or more guest rooms.
"EXCEPTIONS:  1.  A fire alarm system need not be installed in buildings not over two stories in height when all individual dwelling units and contiguous attic and crawl spaces are separated from each other and from public or common areas by at least one-hour fire-resistive occupancy separations and each individual dwelling unit or guest room has direct exit at grade level to a public way, exit court or yard.
"Alarm systems for Group R, Division 1 Occupancies shall consist of not less than an approved and listed system-type initiating device installed in accordance with the manufacturer's instructions.  When activated, such detectors shall initiate an alarm which is audible throughout the building.
"An approved and listed system-type initiating device shall be installed within common areas such as recreational rooms, laundry rooms and furnace rooms of buildings containing Group R, Division 1 Occupancies.
"The detectors shall be installed on the ceiling or wall of such rooms in accordance with the manufacturer's installation instructions and, when activated, shall initiate an alarm which is audible throughout the building.
"(d)  High-Rise Office Buildings and Group R, Division 1 Occupancies.  A fire alarm and communication system complying with the provisions of Section 1807 of the Building Code shall be installed in:
"1.  Group B, Division 2 office buildings 5 or more stories in height.
"2.  Group R, Division 1 Occupancies 5 or more stories in height.
"(e)  Smoke Detectors in Dwelling Units and Guest Rooms.  Smoke detectors shall be installed as required by UBC Section 1210(a) in dwelling units and hotel or lodging house guest rooms.  Detectors may not be interconnected into a fire alarm system.
"(f)  Group R, Division 3 Occupancies.  Any owner, agent or lessee of a Group R, Division 3 occupancy who chooses or is required to install a monitored automatic fire alarm system shall comply with the requirements of this subsection.
"Monitoring of automatic fire alarm systems shall be by an approved remote station monitoring center meeting the requirements of Section 14.110.
"1.  General Requirements.  The fire alarm system shall meet the general requirements of Section 14.102.
"A.  Standards:  The standard for installation of these systems 
shall be the 1984 edition of the National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Standard 74.
"B.  Supervision.  The fire alarm system shall be supervised.  Removal of the signal circuit or loss of power to any initiating device shall cause a system trouble signal in the home and/or at an approved remote station monitoring center.
"2.  Transponder alarm codes.  A distinct and separate code for each fire alarm signal shall be provided.  Signals with messages requiring interpretation are prohibited.  A reset code shall be transmitted when the alarm or trouble condition is cleared.
"3.  Key reset.  A key reset switch shall be provided on the exterior of the dwelling in a location approved by the Fire Chief.  The key switch shall be coded to the fire department key box system.  The location of the key reset shall be indicated on the plans submitted for review.
"EXCEPTION:  Residences not provided with a key reset switch shall contract with an approved remote station monitoring center or remote station monitoring center dealer to investigate signals.  The arrival time of the maintenance personnel shall not exceed 20 minutes.
"Alternative means of determining the validity of an alarm or for providing access may be approved by the Fire Chief.
"4.  Exterior Visual Signal.  A flashing red light shall be installed above the key reset switch.  The light shall activate on all fire alarm signals, except trouble, and stop when reset.
"5.  Interior Audible Signal.  Every initiating device shall cause the sounding of a fire alarm signal which shall be clearly audible in all bedrooms over background noise levels with all intervening doors closed.  The tests of audibility level shall be conducted with all household equipment which may be in operation at night in full operation."
(27)
Section 14.105, Special Provisions, is hereby deleted and amended by the addition of the following:
"(a)  Monitoring.  All required fire alarm systems shall be monitored by an approved remote station monitoring center."
(28)
Section 14.109, Emergency Fire Alarm Inspections, is hereby amended by the addition of the following:
"(a)  General.  All fire alarm systems shall be subject to the provisions of this section.  It shall be the responsibility of the Fire Department to inspect and determine the cause of all fire alarms.
"All fire alarms shall be categorized and a written report made which justifies the determination.
"(b)  Definitions.  The following definitions are applicable only to this section:

"ALARM SYSTEM.  A combination of approved compatible devices with the necessary electrical interconnection and energy to produce an alarm signal in the event of fire or system activation controlled from a fire control location.
"EMERGENCY ALARM INSPECTION.  An inspection to determine the cause of any fire alarm signal.  A written 
report shall be provided to the responsible party detailing the results of the emergency alarm inspection.  Any fire alarm requiring a fire department response will be given an emergency alarm inspection.
"EMERGENCY ALARM INSPECTION FEE.  When any alarm system exceeds the allowable number of Category II alarms, the fire department shall assess an emergency alarm inspection fee upon the premises.
"FIRE ALARM SIGNAL.  A signal indicating an emergency requiring immediate action, as an alarm for fire from a manual box, smoke detector, heat detector, a water flow alarm, an automatic fire alarm system, tamper alarm, trouble alarm or other emergency signal as defined by the fire department.  Fire alarm signals shall be classified as follows:
"CATEGORY I ALARMS.  Any alarm requiring a fire department response where the system operated properly under the following conditions.  These alarms shall not be assessed a fee.
"1.  Malicious.
"A.  Any alarm caused by a malicious or mischievous action.
"B.  An elevator alarm with no extrication required.
"2.  Accidental.  Any alarm caused by the following:
"A.  A guest or circumstances beyond the control of management.
"B.  An accidental smoke or fire condition.
"C.  A sprinkler system activated by a nonfire circumstance.
"CATEGORY II ALARMS.  Any alarm requiring a fire department response under the following conditions.  These alarms shall be termed 'unnecessary' and will be assessed a fee after exceeding the allowable limits.
"1.  System Malfunction.  Any alarm caused by the failure, lack of maintenance, improper maintenance or installation of the alarm system equipment, hardware or wiring.
"2.  User Error.  The act or omission of an agent, employee or contractor of the management.  Failure by a remote station monitoring center shall be considered a user error.
"3.  Undetermined Cause.  Any alarm which, after its investigation by the fire department (with input from interested parties) has no apparent cause.
"FIRE ALARM CONTRACTOR.  Any individual, partnership, corporation or other entity engaged in the selling, designing, leasing, renting, maintaining, servicing, repairing, testing, altering, moving or installing of any alarm system for an alarm owner.
"FIRE CONTROL LOCATION.  The control point of a fire alarm system.  This may include single or multiple fire alarm control panels at a single point or a fire command center.
"LETTER OF CERTIFICATION.  A letter stating that the alarm system has been inspected by an alarm contractor and conforms to the requirements of the adopted fire code, as amended, nationally recognized standards and the installation instructions of the equipment manufacturer.  This letter, in a form acceptable to the fire department, shall also identify the alarm contractor, the owner of the alarm 
system, the address of the alarm system, the date of certification, the reason for the certification and corrections made.
"(c)  Performance Standards.  The intent of this section is to reduce or eliminate unnecessary fire alarms.  Therefore, this section establishes reasonable standards of performance and the corrective actions that will be taken to enforce compliance with these standards.
"1.  It shall be the duty of the fire alarm system owner to maintain, repair or correct a system generating unnecessary alarms.  The owner is also responsible for educating all persons, whether employees or contract agents, who may affect the performance of the alarm system.
"2.  All alarm systems shall be afforded a thirty-day adjustment period commencing with the fire department date of acceptance of the fire alarm system.  The adjustment period is provided so that the system can be brought to maximum reliability.  The emergency alarm inspection fee will not be assessed during this adjustment period.
"3.  Owners or designated agents of alarm systems in violation of fire department policy and this section shall be charged an emergency alarm inspection fee.
"A.  Excessive Alarm Rate.  Any alarm system found to have more Category II alarms within a calendar year than allowed by RED, WHITE AND BLUE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT Resolution, excluding the thirty-day adjustment period, shall be considered in violation of this section.
"B.  Inspection Fee.  Pursuant to Section 32-1-1002(1)(e)(II), C.R.S., as amended, an emergency alarm inspection fee, as determined by RED, WHITE AND BLUE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT Resolution, shall be assessed to the owner or designated agents of any alarm system in violation of this section.
"When a Category II emergency alarm inspection fee has been assessed, the property owner or his designated representative shall be responsible for paying the fee determined by the RED, WHITE AND BLUE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT Resolution.
"Upon assessment, the emergency alarm inspection fee shall constitute a perpetual lien upon the property pursuant to Section 32-1-1001(1)(j), C.R.S., as amended.
"The RED, WHITE AND BLUE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT may, in its discretion, waive any portion or all of such fee.

"C.  Re-Evaluation of Findings.  If the alarm system owner, or his agent, can provide proof of cause within 2 working days from the alarm time, the fire department will re-evaluate the assessment.
"D.  Rebate Eligibility.  Within 30 days following any alarm in violation of this section, the owner may provide the fire department with a letter of certification or service order indicating repairs have been made and then be eligible to receive a 50 percent rebate on the emergency alarm inspection fee.
"E.  Failure to Pay Fee.  Owners of alarm systems more than 90 days in arrears for emergency alarm inspection fees shall have a perpetual lien placed against the property pursuant to Section 32-1-1001(1)(j), C.R.S., as amended.

"4.  The owner of an alarm system generating unnecessary fire alarms may be required to meet with the Fire Chief, or his representative, and the alarm contractor responsible, for the purpose of determining the cause(s) and the solution(s) to the problem(s).
"(d)  Adoption of Fees.  The RED, WHITE AND BLUE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT shall, by resolution, adopt an emergency alarm inspection fee, together with a policy for handling Category II alarms in excess of the allowable number.  Copies of the policy shall be provided to the County of Summit and appropriate municipalities."

(29)
Section 14.110, Remote Station Monitoring Center, is hereby amended by the addition of the following:
"(a)  General.  Remote Station Monitoring Centers, including dealers, that notify the fire department communication center of fire alarm signals shall comply with the requirements of this section.
"(b)  Definition.  The following definitions are applicable only to this section:

"APPROVED.  An approved remote station monitoring center is one which complies with the requirements of this section.
"(c)  Notification and Terminology.  The notification procedure and terminology used shall be determined by the fire department.
"(d)  List of Subscribers.  Quarterly, a list of subscribers shall be provided in a form acceptable to the fire department.
"(e)  Subscriber Information.  Information relative to the fire alarm system shall be provided.  The required information shall be approved prior to the sending of any signals to the fire department communications center.  The fire department shall be provided with written updates whenever any changes are made to the subscriber information.  Subscriber information shall be submitted in a form acceptable to the fire department.
"The information required shall include the property name and owner, physical address, mailing address, premise telephone number, fire alarm signals monitored and their description, names of responsible parties and their telephone numbers.
"(f)  Monthly Report.  Monthly, a report of all signals received showing date, type and location shall be provided to the fire department in a form acceptable to it.
"(g)  Termination of Service.  Properties with monitored fire alarm systems shall not have their service terminated without twenty-four-hour written notification to the fire department.
"(h)  Test Status.  The placing of a fire alarm system on test status or going offline and then online automatically, without first verifying the current status of the system with an on-site representative is prohibited."
(30)
Section 24.101, Airports, Heliports and Helistops, is hereby deleted and amended by the addition of the following:
"This article shall apply to all airports, heliports, helistops and aircraft hangars.  All airports, heliports and helistops shall also provide for the level of protection prescribed in the 1988 edition of National Fire Protection Association Standard 403 and the 1984 edition of National Fire Protection Association Standard 414."
(31)
Section 79.902(e) is hereby amended to read as follows:
"(e)  Class I liquids shall not be dispensed or transferred within a service station building, except as provided in Section 79.903(d).  Class II and Class III-A liquids may be dispensed in lubrication or service rooms of a service station building, provided that the heating equipment complies with Section 79.906 and electrical equipment complies with Section 79.905.  Delivery of any Class I, II or III-A liquid shall not be made into portable containers unless such container is of approved material and construction, having a tight closure with screwed or spring cover, so designed that the contents can be dispensed without spilling."

(32)
The first sentence of Section 79.1007, Division X, Storage of Flammable and Combustible Liquids on Farms and Construction Projects, is hereby amended by the addition of the following:

"(g)  Tanks for Gravity Discharge.  Tanks for use on farms/ranches with a connection in the bottom or the end for gravity-dispensing liquids shall be mounted and equipped as follows:
"1.  Supports to elevate the tank for gravity discharge shall be of adequate strength and design to provide stability.
"2.  Bottom or end openings for gravity discharge shall be equipped with a valve located adjacent to the tank shell which will close automatically in the event of fire through the operation of an effective heat-actuated releasing device.  If this valve cannot be operated manually, it shall be supplemented by a second manually operated valve.  The gravity discharge outlet shall be provided with an approved hose equipped with a self-closing valve at the discharge end of a type that can be padlocked to its hanger."
(33)
Appendix II-C, Marinas, Section 5, is hereby amended to read as follows:
"5.  FIRE-PROTECTION EQUIPMENT.
"All piers, wharves, floats with facilities for mooring or servicing five or more vessels, and marine service stations shall be equipped with fire protection equipment as follows:
"(a)  All portions of floats exceeding 250 feet in distance from fire apparatus access and marine service stations shall be provided with an approved dry standpipe system installed in conformity with applicable standards set forth in the 1986 edition of the National Fire Protection Association Standard 14 and Article 10 of this code.
"1.  At the shore end, the waterline shall be equipped with a single 2½-inch fire department connection.
"2.  Waterlines shall normally be dry where area is subject to freezing temperatures."

(34)
Appendix III-A, Table No. III-A-A, Fire-flow Guide for Buildings Other than One- and Two-Family Dwellings, is hereby amended by the addition of the following:
"TABLE NO. III-A-AFIRE-FLOW GUIDE FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS

CONSTRUCTION TYPE

	FIRE FLOW (Gallons Per Minute)
	I II-F.R.
	II ONE-HR. III ONE-HR.
	IV-H.T. V-ONE-HR.
	II-N III-N
	V-N

	500
	3,300
	1,900
	1,200
	1,000
	500

	750
	6,600
	3,700
	2,400
	1,900
	1,100

	1,000
	10,900
	6,100
	3,900
	2,900
	1,700

	1,250
	16,200
	9,100
	5,800
	4,400
	2,600

	1,500
	22,700
	12,700
	8,200
	5,900
	3,600

	1,750
	30,200
	17,000
	10,900
	7,900
	4,800

	2,000
	38,700
	21,800
	12,900
	9,800
	6,200

	2,250
	48,300
	24,200
	17,400
	12,600
	7,700

	2,500
	59,000
	33,200
	21,300
	15,400
	9,400

	2,750
	70,900
	39,700
	25,500
	18,400
	11,300

	3,000
	83,700
	47,100
	30,100
	21,800
	13,400

	3,250
	97,700
	54,900
	35,200
	25,900
	15,600

	3,500
	112,700
	63,400
	40,600
	29,300
	18,000

	3,750
	128,700
	72,400
	46,400
	33,500
	20,600

	4,000
	145,900
	82,100
	52,500
	37,900
	23,300

	4,250
	164,200
	92,400
	59,100
	42,700
	26,300

	4,500
	183,400
	103,100
	66,000
	47,700
	29,300

	4,750
	203,700
	114,600
	73,300
	53,000
	32,600

	5,000
	225,200
	126,700
	81,100
	58,600
	36,000

	5,250
	247,700
	139,400
	89,200
	65,400
	39,600

	5,500
	271,200
	152,600
	97,700
	70,600
	43,400

	5,750
	295,900
	166,500
	106,500
	77,000
	47,400

	6,000
	UNLIMITED
	UNLIMITED
	115,800
	83,700
	51,500

	6,250
	"
	"
	125,500
	90,600
	55,700

	6,500
	"
	"
	135,500
	97,900
	60,200

	6,750
	"
	"
	145,800
	106,800
	64,800

	7,000
	"
	"
	156,700
	113,200
	69,600

	7,250
	"
	"
	167,900
	121,300
	74,600

	7,500
	"
	"
	179,400
	129,600
	79,800

	7,750
	"
	"
	191,400
	138,300
	85,100

	8,000
	"
	"
	UNLIMITED
	UNLIMITED
	UNLIMITED"


(35)
Appendix IV-D, Reference Tables, from the Uniform Building Code is hereby amended by the addition of the following:
"a.  1988 Uniform Building Code, Table 9-A, Exempt Amounts of Hazardous Materials, Liquids and Chemicals Presenting a Physical Hazard.

"b.  1988 Uniform Building Code, Table 9-B, Exempt Amounts of Hazardous Materials, Liquids and Chemicals Presenting a Health Hazard.

"c.  1988 Uniform Building Code, Table 9-C, Distance From Property Lines, Wall and Opening Protection Based on Location on Property.

"d.  1988 Uniform Building Code, Table 9-D, Minimum Distances For Storage of Explosive Materials.

"e.  1988 Uniform Building Code, Table 9-E, Required Detached Storage."
(Prior code 5-4-5; Ord. 06-01 §1, 2006)

Sec. 18-5-60.
Violations and penalties.

Any person violating any of the provisions of this Chapter shall have his or her license and/or permit revoked or suspended, may be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and shall be punished as provided in Section 1-4-20 of this Code.  (Prior code 5-4-6; Ord. 06-01 §1, 2006)

ARTICLE VI

Energy Conservation Code

Sec. 18-6-10.
Adoption.

The following standard code, as hereinafter amended, is hereby adopted by reference:  the International Energy Conservation Code, 2006 Edition, published by the International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Ave., NW, 6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001-2070.  (Ord. 08-03, 2008)

Sec. 18-6-20.
Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the International Energy Conservation Code, certified to be a true copy, has been and is now on file in the office of the Building Official and may be inspected by any interested person during regular business hours.  The code as finally adopted shall be available for sale to the public through the office of the Town Clerk at a moderate price.  (Ord. 08-03, 2008)

Sec. 18-6-30.
Amendments.

The following amendments are hereby adopted as hereinafter provided:

(1)
Section 101.1 is hereby amended by the addition of the name, "The Town of Blue River."

(2)
Section 301.1, General, is hereby amended to read as follows:

"301.1 General.  The climate zone for the Town of Blue River shall be determined to be Zone 7."

(3)
Chapter 5 is hereby repealed in its entirety.  (Ord. 08-03, 2008)


